
 
Name of the Tool 
 

  
 The International Bibliography of the Social Sciences (IBSS) 
 

 
Home Page 

 

 
 

 
Logo 

 

 
 

 
URL 

  
http://www.proquest.com/libraries/academic/databases/ibss-set-
c.html#overviewlinkSection 

 
Subject  

  
Social science - Bibliography  

 
Accessibility 

  
On subscription basis 

 
Language 

 
Multilingual 

 
Publisher 
 

 
ProQuest 

 
Brief History 
 

 
International Bibliography of the Social Sciences (IBSS) was established in 
1951 by the International Committee for Social Science Information and 
Documentation, a non-governmental organization recognised by UNESCO. 
From 1951 to 1989 it was prepared at the Fondation Nationale des Sciences 
Politiques in Paris and produced in four printed volumes: Economics, 
Political Science, Anthropology and Sociology. From 1989 to 2010 it was 
produced at the British Library of Political and Economic Science of the 
London School of Economics, with the help of funds from the Economic and 



Social Research Council (ESRC) from 1995 to 2009. It was purchased by 
ProQuest in January 2010, and production moved to ProQuest's UK 
headquarters in July that year. It was made available in electronic format via 
CD-ROM in 1993 and it became available online in 1995. 
 

 
Scope and Coverage 

 
IBSS’s main focus is on the four core social science subjects of 
anthropology, economics, politics and sociology. For each of these 
disciplines IBSS provides comprehensive coverage of the international 
literature. IBSS adds additional value to its core coverage by including 
carefully selected complementary material in related subjects, such as human 
geography and environment, development studies and policy studies. In this 
way IBSS’s editorial policy promotes and reflects the interdisciplinary nature 
of the social sciences today. IBSS includes over two million bibliographic 
references to journal articles and to books, reviews and selected chapters 
dating back to 1951. It is unique in its broad coverage of international 
material and incorporates over 100 languages and countries. Over 2,800 
journals are regularly indexed and some 7,000 books are included each year. 
Abstracts are provided for half of all current journal articles and full text 
availability is continually increasing. 
 

 
Kind of Information 

 
This tool provides a long list of entries. Under a particular entry (within the 
list) bibliographic information like title, author name, affiliation, 
ISSN/ISBN, language, publisher name, publication date,  etc. present here. 
An example is given below for clear understanding. 
 

 
 (one entry within a list) 
 

 
  (It is not full bibliographic information) 
 
The complete bibliographic information of a particular entry is given below 
through screen shot example. 
 



 

 
 
 

 
Special Features 

 
 ProQuest offers best-in-class customer service, technical support, and 

training. 
 

 It provides blog. 
 

 It provides other related products like social science collection, social 
science database, and socio-logical abstracts. 
 

 Links to various social networking like Facebook, Twitter, Google+ 
etc. 
 

 IBSS International Bibliography of the Social Sciences Brochure 
(PDF) links available here. 
 
 

 
Arrangement Pattern 

 
For information one can search through quick and advance search option. In 
advance search option one can retrieve their information via various 
narrower options with their dropdown menus. 
Here the advance search window is given below: 
 



 
 
 
Also users can browse via six alphabetical browse able indexes like Author,  
Descriptors, Journal Name, Publisher, Publication Type, and Review Author 
Index. 
 
Author Index. 
 

  
 
 

 
Remarks 

 
The International Bibliography of the Social Sciences (IBSS) is an essential 
online resource for social science and interdisciplinary research.  The online 
database is updated biweekly to ensure that researchers have access to the 
very latest information relating to their particular field of interest. Some 
100,000 records are added to the database annually. 
 

 
Comparable Tools 

 
 The Philosopher’s Index (http://philindex.org/) 
 British and Irish Archaeological Bibliography 

(http://www.biab.ac.uk/) 
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