
                                                                                                                             
Name of the Tool 
 

 

University of California Library (UCLA Library) 

 
 
Home Page 

 

 
 

 
Logo                                

 

 
 

 
URL 

 
http://www.library.ucla.edu/ 

 
Subject 

 
University of California Library--Catalogs 

 
Accessibility 

 
Free 

 
Language 

 
English 

 
Publisher 
 

 
University of California Library 



 
Scope and Coverage 

 

The library provides option to search in ‘Melvyl UC Catalog’ and ‘UCLA Library 
Catalog’. Users may search for huge numbers of books, articles, databases, journals, 
research guides, archives and manuscripts etc. The UCLA Library collections 
contain more than 12 million volumes, 100,000 current serial titles, 950,000 million 
e-books, and 700 subscription databases and also contain maps, microfilm reels, 
archived web sites, record albums, CDs and DVDs, scrolls, photographs, 
government documents, statistical data sets, clay tablets, posters, and other types of 
content. 
 

 
 
Kind of Information 
 

 
 
The Melvyl Catalog provides information about articles, books, journals, and other 
materials held by UCLA, other University of California (UC) campuses, and 
libraries worldwide.  Many records contain links to full-text articles 
from selected databases. Additional materials in all formats, including full-text 
articles from journals and books not indexed in Melvyl, may be accessible from 
the Databases by Subject section. The UCLA Library Catalog provides 
information about the holdings of the UCLA Library, the Southern Regional 
Library Facility (SRLF), and specialized collections across the library campus. It 
includes journals and periodicals by title, but it does not contain journal article titles 
or authors. For indexes to journal articles, user may use Melvyl Catalog. 
 
In the search process, the website provides option to choose from above mentioned 
two types of catalogs. At the left hand side there are options like books, databases, 
journals, research guides, archives and manuscripts etc. to choose type of resources. 
By the UCLA Library catalog Basic search, users may search for the resources by 
choosing following key words: 
 

 
 
The quick limits option (above screen shot) gives provision to short the search 
result, and there are following options: 
 
 
 
 



 

 
 
The Advanced catalog search provides option to formulate search queries by 
Boolean operators. Users may short the search results by the following criterion, 
like location of the resource, type, status, format, language, etc.: 
 

 
 

 
Special Features 

 

 Along with two types of library catalogs, the websites of this university library 
makes possible to search for the university’s huge collections. The following screen 
shots show that under each heading users may search for resources by many ways: 
 

             
 



 

  
 

  
 

 Quick Links to the followings:  
 

 
 
 Through its library website, the university provides various current events news. 
 

 
Arrangement Pattern 

 
In the search result, the resources are arranged by the relevancy of these to the 
search queries. Users may rearrange the search results by the titles or names of 
authors (alphabetical arrangement) or by publication date (chronological 
arrangement). 
 

 
Remarks 

 

The UCLA Library creates a vibrant nexus of ideas, collections, expertise, and 
spaces in which users illuminate solutions for local and global challenges. The 
catalog search as well as other search processes make possible to access the whole 
collection of the university.  

 
 
Comparable Tools 

 
 The University of Illinois Urbana Champaign Library Online Catalogs 

(http://www.library.illinois.edu/catalog/) 



 

  

 

 

 
 University of Calcutta: University Library Online Catalogue 

(http://www.caluniv.ac.in/opac/OPAC.HTM) 
 

 University of Cambridge Library Collections 
(http://www.lib.cam.ac.uk/camlibraries/catalogues.html) 

 

 Harvard Library Catalogs (http://library.harvard.edu/) 
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